THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
&n PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
215 West Garden Street

Pensacola, FL 32502

432 1?

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
November 24, 2010 Fruits and Vegetables, RFP #111003

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

The Bid is for a semi-annual pricing agreement to provide fruits and vegetables (37 items bid; 34
recommended for award) as stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse for school cafeterias
throughout the District. Items will be purchased as needed to meet breakfast and lunch menu
requirements. Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.

Effective Dates: January 1, 2011 through June 30, 2011.

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME: ITEMS AWARDED:  EST. ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:

Cheney Brothers, Inc., Ocala, FL 10 $162,800.00

Dori Foods, Inc., Richmond, VA 1 22,600.00

Kelley Foods of Alabama, Elba, AL 2 4,300.00

US Foodservice-Montgomery, Montgomery, AL 11 80,600.00

Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL 7 81,700.00

US Foodservice-Lakeland, Lakeland, FL 3 56,500.00
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE:

$408,500.00 Est./6 Mos. Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD Bid Responses Received: 9

DATE AND TIME POSTED:

November 24, 2010, 11:15 am Central Time

9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years



THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
215 WEST GARDEN STREET

DATE: November 19, 2010

BID NBR: 111003

PENSACOLA, FL 32502
BID TABULATION

BID TITLE: Fruits and Vegetables

Awarded Items Are Highlighted

If 2 prices are listed, top price is portion or unit cost, i.e. each, can, Ib; bottom price is vendor

unit of issue, i.e. Ib., case. Differences in pack sizes requires items to be awarded by portion cost.

ITEM Applesauce Mandarin Cranberry Fruit,
cn Oranges Sauce Mixed
Quantity: 1,200 cs 500 cs 50 cs 1,200 cs
0501030 0501080 0501090 0501100
ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 4
Cheney Brothers, Inc 2.8650 4.0000 5.8967 4.3833
Ocala, FL 17.19 24.00 35.38 26.30
US Foodservice-Lakeland No bid 4.2300 a No bid No bid
Lakeland, FL 25.38 u
Churchfield Trading Company 3.0567 a No bid No bid 5.8500
Oakland, CA 18.34 35.10
Churchfield Trading Company N/A N/A N/A 3.9567 a
BID 2 23.74 u
Dori Foods Inc 3.2083 No bid No bid No bid
Richmond, VA 19.25
Dori Foods Inc 2.9917 N/A N/A N/A
BID 2 17.95 m
Dori Foods Inc 2.8250 N/A N/A N/A
BID 3 16.95 m
Global Foods 3.0917 a No bid No bid 4.0833 a
Las Vegas, NV 18.55 u 24.50 u
Kelley Foods of Alabama 3.5367 No bid 6.1600 5.3100
Elba, AL 21.22 36.96 31.86
North Oakland Commaodities 2.6633 a No bid 4.4083 m 4.3983 a
Grand Blank, MI 15.98 m,u 26.45 u 26.39 m,u
Sysco Gulf Coast 4.7750 a 4.3250 5.8250 No bid
Geneva, AL 28.65 25.95 34.95
US Foodservice-Montgomery 3.8550 a No bid No bid No bid
Montgomery, AL 23.13 u
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ITEM Peaches, Pears, Pineapple Fruit
Sliced cn Diced cn Tidbits Cup ea
Quantity: 1,200 cs 1,200 cs 1,200 cs 100 cs
0501150 0501160 0501170 0505270
ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7 8
Cheney Brothers, Inc 3.9933 4.5667 49167 0.5264
Ocala, FL 23.96 27.40 29.50 18.95
US Foodservice-Lakeland No bid No bid 4.8300 No bid
Lakeland, FL 28.98
Churchfield Trading Company 5.8217 5.4900 No bid No bid
Oakland, CA 34.93 32.94
BID 2 3.8300 a N/A N/A N/A
Oakland, CA 22.98 u
Dori Foods Inc No bid No bid No bid No bid
Richmond, VA
Global Foods 3.9833 a No bid No bid No bid
Las Vegas, NV 23.90 u
Kelley Foods of Alabama 5.1900 4.7550 No bid No bid
Elba, AL 31.14 28.53
North Oakland Commodities 4.0983 a,u 4.0633 a No bid No bid
Grand Blank, Ml 24.59 m 24.38 m
Sysco Gulf Coast 3.6000 4,9917 5.3333 No bid
Geneva, AL 21.60 29.95 32.00
US Foodservice-Montgomery No bid No bid No bid No bid
Montgomery, AL
ITEM Frozen Frozen 100% Fruit Beans,
Strawberries Ib Cherries  Ib| Juice Cup Vegetarian
QUALITY: 75 cs 75 cs 2,100 cs 400 cs
0513130 0513140 0517470 0502011
ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 12
Cheney Brothers, Inc 1.2621 a No bid 0.2344 3.5750
Ocala, FL 49.22 22.50 21.45
US Foodservice-Lakeland No bid No bid 0.2400 No bid
Lakeland, FL 23.04
Churchfield Trading Company No bid No bid No bid No bid
Oakland, CA
Dori Foods Inc No bid No bid No bid No bid
Richmond, VA
Global Foods No bid No bid No bid No bid
Las Vegas, NV
Kelley Foods of Alabama No bid 1.3040 No bid 3.5767
Elba, AL 39.12 21.46
North Oakland Commodities No bid No bid No bid No bid
Grand Blank, MI
Sysco Gulf Coast 1.1821 2.5950 a 0.2484 3.6833
Geneva, AL 46.10 25.95 u 23.85 22.10
US Foodservice-Montgomery No bid No bid 0.2417 3.2833
Montgomery, AL 23.20 19.70
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ITEM Beans, Beans, Sweet Potatoes,
Green cn Kidney Potatoes Instant
QUALITY: 1,200 cs 30 cs 50 cs 500 cs
0502020 0502050 0502280 0502290
ITEM NUMBER 13 14 15 16
Cheney Brothers, Inc 3.3000 3.8000 a No bid No bid
Ocala, FL 19.80 22.80 u
US Foodservice-Lakeland No bid No bid No bid No bid
Lakeland, FL
Churchfield Trading Company No bid No bid No bid No bid
Oakland, CA
Dori Foods Inc 3.1417 No bid No bid No bid
Richmond, VA 18.85
Global Foods No bid No bid No bid No bid
Las Vegas, NV
Kelley Foods of Alabama 3.6683 3.5767 4.7017 5.5317 a
Elba, AL 22.01 21.46 28.21 33.19 u
North Oakland Commodities 2.7250 a No bid No bid No bid
Grand Blank, MI 16.35 m,u
Sysco Gulf Coast 5.0333 a 3.8250 4.4917 a 5.8500 a
Geneva, AL 30.20 u 22.95 26.95 u 35.10 u
US Foodservice-Montgomery 3.2833 3.2833 4.4167 No bid
Montgomery, AL 19.70 19.70 26.50
Not Awarded
ITEM Tomato Tomato Broccoli Chili, Canned,
Paste cn Sauce Cuts Ib No Beans
QUALITY: 150 cs 150 cs 1,200 cs 75 cs
0502370 0502380 0514040 0504050
ITEM NUMBER 17 18 19 20
Cheney Brothers, Inc 4.8400 3.2500 1.0967 No bid
Ocala, FL 29.04 19.50 26.32
US Foodservice-Lakeland 4.8700 m 3.3000 m No bid 9.1600 m
Lakeland, FL 29.22 19.80 54.96
Churchfield Trading Company No bid No bid No bid No bid
Oakland, CA
Dori Foods Inc No bid No bid 1.2063 No bid
Richmond, VA 28.95
Global Foods No bid No bid No bid No bid
Las Vegas, NV
Kelley Foods of Alabama No bid No bid No bid 10.0583
Elba, AL 60.35
North Oakland Commodities No bid No bid No bid No bid
Grand Blank, MI
Sysco Gulf Coast 4.,9583 3.7750 1.0317 8.8750
Geneva, AL 29.75 22.65 30.95 53.25
US Foodservice-Montgomery No bid No bid No bid No bid

Montgomery, AL
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ITEM Carrots, Corn, Whole Corn-on- Turnip
Sliced Ib Kernel Ib the-cob Greens Ib
QUALITY: 400 cs 1,600 cs 100 cs 250 cs
0514101 0514122 0514130 0514140
ITEM NUMBER 21 22 23 24
Cheney Brothers, Inc 0.6304 0.6640 a No bid No bid
Ocala, FL 15.13 19.92
US Foodservice-Lakeland No bid 0.5740 m 0.1490 m No bid
Lakeland, FL 11.48 14.30
Churchfield Trading Company No bid No bid No bid No bid
Oakland, CA
Dori Foods Inc 0.8021 No bid No bid No bid
Richmond, VA 19.25
Global Foods No bid No bid No bid No bid
Las Vegas, NV
Kelley Foods of Alabama No bid No bid 0.1446 No bid
Elba, AL 13.88
North Oakland Commodities No bid No bid No bid No bid
Grand Blank, MI
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.7417 0.7650 a 0.1589 0.8167
Geneva, AL 17.80 22.95 15.25 29.40
US Foodservice-Montgomery No bid 0.6235 No bid 0.6723
Montgomery, AL 12.47 20.17
ITEM Spinach Squash, Oriental-Style Mixed
Ib Yellow Mixed Veg. Vegetables Ib
QUALITY: 50 cs 50 cs 300 cs 200 cs
0514150 0514160 0514230 0514251
ITEM NUMBER 25 26 27 28
Cheney Brothers, Inc No bid No bid No bid 0.8005
Ocala, FL 16.01
US Foodservice-Lakeland No bid No bid No bid No bid
Lakeland, FL
Churchfield Trading Company No bid No bid No bid No bid
Oakland, CA
Dori Foods Inc No bid No bid No bid 0.9195
Richmond, VA 18.39
Global Foods No bid No bid No bid No bid
Las Vegas, NV
Kelley Foods of Alabama No bid No bid No bid No bid
Elba, AL
North Oakland Commodities No bid No bid No bid No bid
Grand Blank, MI
Sysco Gulf Coast 1.1417 1.1208 1.1229 0.9208
Geneva, AL 27.40 26.90 26.95 22.10
US Foodservice-Montgomery 0.6833 No bid No bid 0.8125
Montgomery, AL 24.60 16.25
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ITEM Green Lima Peas, Potato Potatoes, Fries
Beans Green Wedges b |Shoestring Ib
QUALITY: 200 cs 600 cs 500 cs 1,000 cs
0514291 0514301 0514311 0514321
ITEM NUMBER 29 30 31 32
Cheney Brothers, Inc No bid No bid 0.6583 0.6296
Ocala, FL 19.75 17.00
US Foodservice-Lakeland 0.8400 m No bid No bid No bid
Lakeland, FL 16.80
Churchfield Trading Company No bid No bid No bid No bid
Oakland, CA
Dori Foods Inc No bid No bid No bid 0.5919
Richmond, VA 15.98
Global Foods No bid No bid No bid No bid
Las Vegas, NV
Kelley Foods of Alabama No bid No bid No bid No bid
Elba, AL
North Oakland Commodities No bid No bid No bid No bid
Grand Blank, MI
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.9025 0.7933 a 0.5933 0.7130
Geneva, AL 18.05 23.80 u 17.80 19.25
US Foodservice-Montgomery 1.1900 No bid 0.5553 0.4223
Montgomery, AL 23.80 16.66 12.67
Not Awarded
ITEM Potato Hash Potatoes, Curley
Chunks Browns Ib| Tater Tots Ib Fries
QUALITY: 500 cs 200 cs 600 cs 500 cs
0514361 0514380 0514401
ITEM NUMBER 33 34 35 36
Cheney Brothers, Inc No bid 1.0850 0.7443 0.8517
Ocala, FL 32.55 22.33 25.55
US Foodservice-Lakeland No bid No bid No bid No bid
Lakeland, FL
Churchfield Trading Company No bid No bid No bid No bid
Oakland, CA
Dori Foods Inc No bid 0.5817 No bid
Richmond, VA 25.75 u 17.45
Global Foods No bid No bid No bid No bid
Las Vegas, NV
Kelley Foods of Alabama No bid No bid No bid No bid
Elba, AL
North Oakland Commodities No bid No bid No bid No bid
Grand Blank, MI
Sysco Gulf Coast No bid 0.9333 0.6817 0.9146
Geneva, AL 28.00 20.45 21.95
US Foodservice-Montgomery No bid 0.7083 0.5223 0.8192
Montgomery, AL 11.99 15.67 19.66
Not Awarded
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ITEM

Shoestring

Oven Fries XL |b

QUALITY: 1,200 cs
0514410
ITEM NUMBER 37
Cheney Brothers, Inc 0.6637
Ocala, FL 19.91
US Foodservice-Lakeland No bid
Lakeland, FL
Churchfield Trading Company No bid
Oakland, CA
Dori Foods Inc 0.7317
Richmond, VA 21.95
Global Foods No bid
Las Vegas, NV
Kelley Foods of Alabama No bid
Elba, AL
North Oakland Commodities No bid
Grand Blank, MI
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.7067
Geneva, AL 21.20
US Foodservice-Montgomery 0.6077
Montgomery, AL 18.23

a = Alternate product or bid

u = Alternate product or bid not acceptable

m = Minimum delivery quantity bid by vendor

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing
Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at

http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in

Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.
Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing

website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

| hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received
in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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